RESOLUTION
of the
BOROUGH OF NEW PROVIDENCE
Resolution No. 2019-218

Council Meeting Date: 09-09-2019 Date Adopted: 09-09-2019

TITLE: RESOLUTION OF THE BOROUGH OF NEW PROVIDENCE, COUNTY
OF UNION, STATE OF NEW JERSEY REJECTING ALL BIDS FOR
PROJECT KNOW AS GROVE FIELD RENOVATIONS

Councilperson_Muiioz submitted the following resolution, which was duly seconded by
Councilperson Geoffroy.

WHEREAS, Borough of New Providence, authorized bids for the project known
as Grove Field Renovations; and

WHEREAS, on August 28, 2019 the Borough received and opened three (3)
bids; and

WHEREAS, upon review of the bids it was determined that the bids exceeded
the budgeted amount for the project; and

WHEREAS, the foregoing requires that the bids be rejected.

NOW, THEREFORE, IT BE RESOLVED by the Mayor and Council of the
Borough of New Providence, County of Union, State of New Jersey, that the bids
received on August 28, 2019 for project known as Grove Field Renovations are hereby
rejected and that the bid submissions be returned to the bidders.

APPROVED, this 9" day of September, 2019.
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| hereby certify that the above resolution was adopted at a meeting of the Borough

Council held on the 9" day of September, 2019.

Wendi B. Barry, Borough Clerk
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September 5, 2019
VIA E-MAIL

Wendi Barry, Borough Clerk
Borough of New Providence
360 Elkwood Avenue

New Providence, NJ 07974

Re:  Bid Summary/Recommendation to Reject
Grove Field Renovations
Borough of New Providence, Union County, New Jersey
Maser Consulting Project No. NPT-004

Dear Ms. Barry:

The bid opening for the above-referenced project was held on Wednesday August 28, 2019 at
11:00 a.m. with the Engineer Representative, Kevin Boyer, P.E., and the Borough’s Deputy Clerk,
Denise Brinkofski, present. Bids were received from three (3) contractors.

Based on a review of the summary of bids and contract documents, it is our recommendation that
the Borough reject all bids as the amount exceeds the Borough’s budgeted amount for this project.
The bid tabulation is attached for your review.

Please contact me if you have any questions regarding the referenced project.

Very truly yours,

. Hipolit, P.E., P.P., C.M.E.
Borough Engineer

KB/nm/ljb
Attachment: Bid Tabulation

cc: Mayor and Council (via Clerk/Administrator wbarry@newprov.org)
Douglas Marvin (via email dmarvin@newprov.org)
Keith Lynch (via email klynch@newprov.org)
Ralph Parlapiano, DPW Superintendent (rparlapiano@newprov.org)
Paul Rizzo, Borough Attorney (via email prizzo@newjerseylaw.net)

r:\projects\npt\npt-004 grove field renovation\correspondence\out\190905_barry_recommendation to reject.docx
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BID TABULATION

DATE: WEDNESDAY, AUGUST 28,2019 @ 11 AM.

NAME OF PROJECT: GROVE FIELD RENOVATION

MC PROJECT NO.:  NPT-004 BIDDER 1 BIDDER 2 BIDDER 3 BIDDER 4 BIDDER 5 BIDDER 6

MUNICIPALITY: BOROUGH OF NEW PROVIDENCE Your Way Construction Aspen Landscaping Contracting Zenith Construction Applied Landscape Technologies ConstructConnect Dodge Data Analytics

COUNTY: UNION 404 Coit Street 1121 Springfield Road 365 Thomas Blvd 145 River Road 30 Technology Parkway South Ste 100 4300 Beltway Place

Suite 150
Irvington, NJ 07111 Union, NJ 07083 Orange, NJ 07050 Montville, NJ 07045 Norcross, GA 30092 Arlington, TX 76018
BASE BID 973-849-6614 973-900-9184 908-964-8883 908-964-8835 201-538-7687 - 973-402-6544 - 800-364-2059 - 413-507-0211 -
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTy. UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT
1 SOIL EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL MEASURES LS 1 $ 6,075.00 | $ 6,075.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
2 CLEARING SITE LS 1 $ 116,950.00 | $ 116,950.00 | $ 53,000.00 | $ 53,000.00 | $ 150,000.00 | $ 150,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
3 HOT MIX ASPHALT PAVEMENT REPAIR sy 92 $ 81.00 | $ 7,452.00 $ 275.00 | $ 25,300.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 3,680.00 $ - $ - $ -
4 1" X 12" PERFORATED UNDERDRAIN PIPE (IF/WHERE DIRECTED) LF 1500 $ 290 $ 4,350.00 $ 2200 $ 33,000.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 30,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
5 8D|I:IEE§'I|':I?|;ATED ] I RO VLN (FIAE (HRURERE LF 700 $ 450 $ 3,150.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 18,900.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 28,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
6 a:gﬁLE S, 4L, @AY ED Sl RN LN NG, & UNIT 2 $ 770.00 | $ 1,540.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
7 GALVANIZED STEEL CHAIN LINK FENCE, 8' HIGH LF 300 $ 55.00 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 35.00| $ 10,500.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 22,500.00 $ - $ - $ -
8 PORTABLE PITCHER'S MOUND UNIT 1 $ 4,250.00 | $ 4,250.00( $ 4,800.00 | $ 4,800.00( $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
9 HOME PLATE UNIT 1 $ 41850 | $ 41850 | $ 521.00 | $ 521.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 650.00 $ - $ - $ -
10 BASEBALL BASE UNIT 3 $ 349.30 | $ 1,047.90 | $ 346.00 | $ 1,038.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 1,950.00 $ - $ - $ -
11 DUGOUT (INCLUDING CONCRETE SLAB, SHELTER AND BENCHES) UNIT 2 $ 22,280.00 | $ 44,560.00 | $ 39,500.00 | $ 79,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
12 INFIELD CLAY, 6" THICK Sy 1032 $ 38.80| $ 40,04160( $ 58.00 | $ 59,856.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 51,600.00 $ - $ - $ -
13 CLAY CONDITIONER POUND 1200 $ 130 § 1,560.00 | $ 3.00| $ 3,600.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 12,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
14 SAND FOR AMENDING TOPSOIL (IF/WHERE DIRECTED) TON 400 $ 100 $ 400.00| $ 70.00 | $ 28,000.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 20,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
15 IRRIGATION SYSTEM LS 1 $ 34,650.00 | $ 34,650.00 | $ 48,500.00 | $ 48,500.00 | $ 75,000.00 | $ 75,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
16 SITE UTILITY UPGRADES - WATER LS 1 $ 30,840.00 | $ 30,840.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
17 2" TYPE K COPPER WATER SERVICE LF 275 $ 64.10 | $ 17,627.50 | $ 62.00 | $ 17,050.00 | $ 30.00| $ 8,250.00 $ - $ - $ -
18 TOPSOILING, 6" THICK Sy 357 $ 9.00| $ 3,213.00( $ 21.00| $ 7,497.00( $ 1000 | $ 3,570.00 $ - $ - $ -
19 SANDY LOAM TOPSOIL (IF/WHERE DIRECTED) TON 400 $ 100 $ 400.00 | $ 81.00 | $ 32,400.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 28,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
20 FERTILIZING AND SEEDING Sy 357 $ 100 $ 357.00| $ 6.36| $ 227052 $ 3.00| $ 1,071.00 $ - $ - $ -
21 SODDING sy 9924 $ 624§ 61,925.76 | $ 450 $ 44,658.00 | $ 1200 $ 119,088.00 $ - $ - $ -
22 STRAW MULCHING Sy 357 $ 100 $ 357.00| $ 1200 | $ 4,284.00( $ 100 $ 357.00 $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL BASE BID $ 397,665.26 $ 534,174.52 $ 725,716.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
R:\Projects\NPT\NPT-004 Grove Field Renovation\Project Information\Bidding and Construction\Bid Tabulation\Bidders_Results_Tabulations_NPT004.xlsx Page 1 of 2




BID TABULATION

DATE:

NAME OF PROJECT:
MC PROJECT NO.:
MUNICIPALITY:
COUNTY:

WEDNESDAY, AUGUST 28, 2019 @ 11 A.M.

GROVE FIELD RENOVATION
NPT-004

BOROUGH OF NEW PROVIDENCE
UNION

ALTERNATE BID 'A’' - PITCHER'S MOUND

BIDDER 1

BIDDER 2

BIDDER 3

BIDDER 4

BIDDER 5

BIDDER 6

Your Way Construction
404 Coit Street

Irvington, NJ 07111

Aspen Landscaping Contracting
1121 Springfield Road

Union, NJ 07083

Zenith Construction
365 Thomas Blvd

Orange, NJ 07050

Applied Landscape Technologies
145 River Road

Montville, NJ 07045

ConstructConnect
30 Technology Parkway South Ste 100

Norcross, GA 30092

Dodge Data Analytics
4300 Beltway Place
Suite 150
Arlington, TX 76018

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT
1A CLAY PITCHER'S MOUND WITH RUBBER LS 1 $ 4,938.30 | $ 4,938.30( $ 1,125.00 | $ 1,125.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
2A zgR;)ABLE IS RS MOUND (=) INEERT UM s (RelR M= UNIT (1) $ 4,250.00 | $ (4,250.00)| $ 4,800.00 | $ (4,800.00)| $ 10,000.00 | $ (10,000.00) $ - $ - $ -

TOTAL ALTERNATE BID A $ 688.30 $ (3,675.00) $ (5,000.00) NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATE BID 'B' - FOUL POLES
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT
1B 20' HIGH FOUL POLE UNIT 2 $ 2,550.00 | $ 5,100.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL ALTERNATE BID 'B' $ 5,100.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 5,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BID SCENARIO TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT
BASE BID| $ 397,665.26 | $ 534,174.52 | $ 725,716.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID 'A'| $ 398,353.56 | $ 530,499.52 | $ 720,716.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BASE BID + ALTERNATE BID 'A' + ALTERNATE BID 'B'| $ 403,453.56 | $ 540,499.52 | $ 725,716.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
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